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After almost a year of researching and
collecting good practices in
intergenerational education, we are proud
to share this first result of the project with
our community of adult educators through
the "Learn to Learn" platform:
https://trainingclub.eu/age/

The platform contains more than 100 good
practices of intergenerational co-learning
in English, Spanish, Greek, Polish and
Romanian, and a forum to exchange
comments on our collection of practices or
other issues related to lifelong learning at
international level.

The Learning Age project also aims to
improve the training offered by adult
education centers through innovative
strategies that invite participation in
training based on the methodology of
intergenerational learning.
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The next step of the project AGE will
focus on intergenerational workshops
about new technologies. The workshops
will result in the development and
production of educational video
materials. The effects are coming soon.
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